
Apartment for sale in Atalaya, Estepona 375,000 €
Reference: R4885114  Bedrooms: 2  Bathrooms: 2  Plot Size: 26m  Build Size: 106m  Terrace: 32m2 2 2
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Costa del Sol, Atalaya

If you are looking for a resort out of the ordinary and a quiet oasis close to everything, then you have come to the right
place. Cor1jo del Mar is perfectly located in the golden triangle between Marbella, Estepona and Benahavis. Here you
are within a short driving distance of the men1oned ci1es and within walking distance of all services. The area has a
large pool with a beach effect and a lifeguard most of the year. Beautiful flourishing and well maintained garden. With a
restaurant open for large parts of the year, there is always a bite to eat, a drink or an ice-cold ice cream close at hand.
Cor1jo del Mar has a recep1on with a rental sec1on, which simplifies and maximizes the poten1al to rent out the
apartment, high ra1ngs on booking sites make the resort very popular. 5 minutes&apos; walk from the resort there is a
well-known Country Club, which is much appreciated by both owners and tenants. There is everything for the whole
family such as heated indoor pool, gym, yoga and fitness classes, massage and beauty treatments, restaurant, library
with open fire, 9-hole golf course, tennis and padel. 

Hall: When you enter the apartment, you are greeted by a large hall, which is not common in Spanish apartments.
There is plenty of room for hanging and storage. 

Living room: Further you enter the generous living room with space for dining room furniture and a large sofa group.
The floor plan is more square than rectangular, which gives a spacious and airy feeling. 

Terrace: a fully glazed window wall with sliding doors leads out to the apartment&apos;s covered terrace, which then
leads on to its own garden of 26m2. The terrace has room for a large dining group and sofa group. With its southern
exposure, the covered terrace is much appreciated on warmer days and the garden is perfect when you want to enjoy
the sun, the best of both worlds. From the garden you have direct access to the pool area, the pool is reached with a
few steps. 

Kitchen: The kitchen is directly adjacent to the living room and has plenty of storage. Kitchen interior from Siema1c
with stone worktop and all white goods including dishwasher from Siemens. From the kitchen you reach the u1lity
room with washing machine and other technical equipment. Several owners have opened up between the kitchen,
living room and hall, which is technically possible and requires little effort. 

Master bedroom: inner hall with inset sliding doors and spacious wardrobes and entrance to en-suite bathroom with
Jacuzzi bath and double glass vani1es. Generous sleeping area with room for a large double bed, bedside table and
additional furniture against the wall. Recessed spotlights and fully glazed sliding door section towards the terrace. 

Guest room: On the opposite side and separated from the master bedroom is another spacious bedroom with room for
two single beds or a larger double bed. Generous wardrobes and space for addi1onal storage. Window with a high
position towards the garden and a view towards the mountains. 

Guest bathroom: For the guest room and the rest of the apartment, there is a bathroom with a walk-in shower and
overhead shower. 

Other: The apartment has a very aDrac1ve loca1on in the resort. The apartment includes a garage space and a storage
room large enough for golf clubs, bicycles, etc., which can be reached by elevator in close proximity to the apartment.
As not all apartments have storage, it gives the apartment a great added value and is appreciated if you are ren1ng out
and want to store private belongings. In all rooms, including the terrace, there are speakers that are controlled from the
living room. The fee to the associa1on includes internet and maintenance of the private garden. The resort is gated
with 24-hour security all year round. The area is very safe, but thanks to this you get the extra security if you leave the
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apartment for longer periods of 1me. Recep1on can provide rentals, help with ac1vi1es, cleaning, concierge services,
key keeping, etc. Very well maintained and beau1ful garden and pool area. If you wish to rent out the apartment, there
is a very professional and flexible arrangement via the reception with very good income opportunities.
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Features:
Features 
Covered Terrace 
Near Transport 
Private Terrace 
Storage Room 
Ensuite Bathroom 
Double Glazing 
Fitted Wardrobes 
WiFi 
Utility Room 
Bar 
Domotics 
Restaurant On Site 
Car Hire Facility 

Orientation 
South 

Climate Control 
Air Conditioning 
Cold A/C 
Hot A/C 

Views 
Garden 

Setting 
Commercial Area 
Close To Golf 
Urbanisation 
Close To Sea 
Close To Shops 
Close To Schools 
Suburban 

Condition 
Good 
Excellent 

Pool 
Communal 
Children`s Pool 

Furniture 
Optional 

Kitchen 
Fully Fitted 

Garden 
Private 
Easy Maintenance 

Security 
Gated Complex 
24 Hour Security 
Electric Blinds 
Entry Phone 

Parking 
Underground 
Garage 
Communal 

Utilities 
Electricity 
Drinkable Water 
Telephone 

Category 
Holiday Homes 
Investment 
Golf 
Luxury 
Resale 

Energy Rating 
E 

CO2 Emission Rating 
D 
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